



**THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING & BUSINESS SERVICES DEPARTMENT**

BID AWARD NOTICE

DATE:
June 12, 2014

BID TITLE & REFERENCE:
Food Processing: USDA Commodities, RFP #142003

DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE:

An annual pricing agreement to provide processing of USDA commodity food items into ready to use products for use in the preparation of school lunches. This solicitation is awarded by commodity items (lots) and not by line item. Bidders meeting specifications with the aggregate low price for the commodity/lot, based on District usage, are the awardee(s) for each area. Fifty-seven (57) items bid; forty-nine (49) items are awarded.

Effective Dates: August 1, 2014 through July 31, 2015.

REQUESTED BY:

Food Services

SUPPLIER NAME:	ITEMS AWARDED:	ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE:
Asian Foods, Oviedo, FL	4	\$ 223,360.00
Bongards Creameries, Bongards, MN	3	32,800.00
Brookwood Farms, Siler City, NC	1	13,950.00
ConAgra Foods Troy, OH	1	7,800.00
High Liner Foods, Drivers, MA	1	11,400.00
Jennie-O Turkey, Willmar, MN	6	127,500.00
JTM Food Group, Harrison, OH	11	260,700.00
Michael Foods, Minnetonka, MN	1	15,900.00
Red Gold, Elwood, IN	7	95,800.00
Tasty Brands, Hicksville, NY	1	44,840.00
Tyson Sales, Springdale, AR	13	765,760.00

AMOUNT OF PURCHASE:

\$1,599,810.00 Est. / Yr.

FUNDING SOURCE:

Food Services Fund (4110)

METHOD OF PROCUREMENT:

ECSD Bid

Responses Received: 27

Bids Rejected: 1

DATE AND TIME POSTED:

June 12, 2014, 2:45 pm Central Time

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505
BID TABULATION

DATE: May 21, 2013

BID NBR: 142003

BID TITLE: Food Processing: USDA Commodities

Awarded Items are highlighted

Item No.	Vendor	Advance Pierre Cincinnati, OH	American Foods Group Oklahoma City, OK	Asian Food Solutions Oviedo, FL	Beaver Valley Aliquippa, PA	Bongards Bongards, MN	Brookwood Farms Siler City, NC	Cargill Kitchen Monticello, MN	Cargill Meat Solutions Wichita, KS	Chef's Corner Foods Hayward, CA	ConAgra Foods Troy, OH	ES Foods Woodbury, NY
1	Sweet and Sour Chicken (0516820)	No Bid	No Bid	a-Y	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	a-y	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:			3.9000						3.9200		
	Portions/Case:			176.0000						171.0000		
	Case Size:			42.9000						2.0000		
	Pounds DF/Case:			34.6500						39.0800		
	Fee For Service/Case:			84.6600						80.9100		
	DF # Value/Case			24.0200						27.0900		
	Net (NOI) Price/Case			84.6600						80.9100		
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion			0.4810						0.4731		
	Unit Price Per lb:			1.9734						1.9264		
2	Smoked BBQ Teriyaki Chicken (0516830)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:			2.8500						2.8000		
	Portions/Case:			240.0000						200.0000		
	Case Size:			42.9000						35.0000		
	Pounds DF/Case:			45.9800						39.7000		
	Fee For Service/Case:			79.4400						70.0000		
	DF # Value/Case			31.8800						27.1600		
	Net (NOI) Price/Case			79.4400						70.0000		
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion			0.3310						0.3500		
	Unit Price Per lb:			1.8517						2.0000		
3	Mandarin Orange Chicken (0516840)	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:			3.9000						3.9200		
	Portions/Case:			176.0000						171.0000		
	Case Size:			42.9000						42.0000		
	Pounds DF/Case:			34.6500						39.0800		
	Fee For Service/Case:			84.6600						81.7900		
	DF # Value/Case			24.0200						27.0900		
	Net (NOI) Price/Case			84.6600						81.7900		
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion			0.4810						0.4783		
	Unit Price Per lb:			1.9734						1.9474		

Item No.	Vendor	Advance Pierre Cincinnati, OH	American Foods Group Oklahoma City, OK	Asian Food Solutions Oviedo, FL	Beaver Valley Aliquippa, PA	Bongards Bongards, MN	Brookwood Farms Siler City, NC	Cargill Kitchen Monticello, MN	Cargill Meat Solutions Wichita, KS	Chef's Corner Foods Hayward, CA	ConAgra Foods Troy, OH	ES Foods Woodbury, NY
20	Beef Taco Meat - Reduced Sodium (0516170)	a-u	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:	2.4000					No Bid					
	Portions/Case:	220.0000										
	Case Size:	33.0000										
	Pounds DF/Case:	20.1400										
	Fee For Service/Case:	28.8500										
	DF # Value/Case	44.8500										
	Net (NOI) Price/Case											
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion											
	Unit Price Per lb:	0.8742										
21	Beef Meatballs (0516191)		m	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:	2.5000	0.5000									
	Portions/Case:	192.0000	960.0000									
	Case Size:	30.0000	30.0000									
	Pounds DF/Case:	23.4000	26.0000									
	Fee For Service/Case:	18.2400	25.0300									
	DF # Value/Case	52.1100	57.9000									
	Net (NOI) Price/Case	0.0950	25.0300									
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion		0.0260									
	Unit Price Per Portion:		0.1300									
22	Turkey Sausage, Patty (0516210)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	m	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:								1.3000			
	Portions/Case:								369.0000			
	Case Size:								30.0000			
	Pounds DF/Case:								33.0000			
	Fee For Service/Case:								49.5000			
	DF # Value/Case								35.7500			
	Net (NOI) Price/Case								49.5000			
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion								0.1340			
	Unit Price Per Poriton:								0.1341			

Item No.	Vendor	Advance Pierre Cincinnati, OH	American Foods Group Oklahoma City, OK	Asian Food Solutions Oviedo, FL	Beaver Valley Aliquippa, PA	Bongards Bongards, MN	Brookwood Farms Siler City, NC	Cargill Kitchen Monticello, MN	Cargill Meat Solutions Wichita, KS	Chef's Corner Foods Hayward, CA	ConAgra Foods Troy, OH	ES Foods Woodbury, NY
23	Turkey Ham (0516221)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:											
	Portions/Case:											
	Case Size:											
	Pounds DF/Case:											
	Fee For Service/Case:											
	DF # Value/Case											
	Net (NOI) Price/Case											
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion											
	Unit Price Per lb:											
24	Turkey Ham, Deli Style (0516220)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	m	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:								3.4300			
	Portions/Case:								140.0000			
	Case Size:								30.0000			
	Pounds DF/Case:								29.0200			
	Fee For Service/Case:								47.4000			
	DF # Value/Case								31.4400			
	Net (NOI) Price/Case								47.4000			
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion								0.3390			
	Unit Price Per lb:								1.5800			
25	Roast Turkey Breast, Sliced (0516340)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	a-Y, m	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:								3.9300			
	Portions/Case:								122.0000			
	Case Size:								30.0000			
	Pounds DF/Case:								27.7400			
	Fee For Service/Case:								49.5000			
	DF # Value/Case								30.0500			
	Net (NOI) Price/Case								49.5000			
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion								0.4050			
	Unit Price Per lb:								1.6500			

Item No.	Vendor	Advance Pierre Cincinnati, OH	American Foods Group Oklahoma City, OK	Asian Food Solutions Oviedo, FL	Beaver Valley Aliquippa, PA	Bongards Bongards, MN	Brookwood Farms Siler City, NC	Cargill Kitchen Monticello, MN	Cargill Meat Solutions Wichita, KS	Chef's Corner Foods Hayward, CA	ConAgra Foods Troy, OH	ES Foods Woodbury, NY
32	Beef, Mini Cheeseburgers (0515090)	a-u	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:	4.7000										
	Portions/Case:	96.0000										
	Case Size:	28.2000										
	Pounds DF/Case:	10.3600										
	Fee For Service/Case:	53.4200										
	DF # Value/Case	23.0700										
	Net (NOI) Price/Case											
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion											
	Unit Price Per Portion:	0.5565										
33	Beef, Shaved Steak (Philly Steak) (0517530)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:											
	Portions/Case:											
	Case Size:											
	Pounds DF/Case:											
	Fee For Service/Case:											
	DF # Value/Case											
	Net (NOI) Price/Case											
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion											
	Unit Price Per lb:											
34	Pork, BBQ, Shredded (0516940)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:						4.0000					
	Portions/Case:						80.0000					
	Case Size:						20.0000					
	Pounds DF/Case:						22.8000					
	Fee For Service/Case:						31.0000					
	DF # Value/Case						25.7600					
	Net (NOI) Price/Case											
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion											
	Unit Price Per lb:						1.5500					

Item No.	Vendor	Advance Pierre Cincinnati, OH	American Foods Group Oklahoma City, OK	Asian Food Solutions Oviedo, FL	Beaver Valley Aliquippa, PA	Bongards Bongards, MN	Brookwood Farms Siler City, NC	Cargill Kitchen Monticello, MN	Cargill Meat Solutions Wichita, KS	Chef's Corner Foods Hayward, CA	ConAgra Foods Troy, OH	ES Foods Woodbury, NY
38	Jalapeno Cheese Sauce, Reduced Fat (0507172)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:											
	Portions/Case:											
	Case Size:											
	Pounds DF/Case:											
	Fee For Service/Case:											
	DF # Value/Case											
	Net (NOI) Price/Case											
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion											
	Unit Price Per Case:											
39	American Cheese, Yellow Sliced, Reduced Fat and Reduced Sodium (0516350)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Portion Size - ozs.:					0.5000						0.5000
	Portions/Case:					640.0000						960.0000
	Case Size:					20.0000						30.0000
	Pounds DF/Case:					14.4800						22.8000
	Fee For Service/Case:					13.3500						29.7000
	DF # Value/Case					26.5000						41.7300
	Net (NOI) Price/Case					39.8500						29.7000
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion					0.0410						0.0309
	Unit Price Per lb:					0.6675						0.0744
40	American Cheese, White Sliced, Reduced Fat (0516352)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	(u)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Not	Portion Size - ozs.:					0.5000						
Aw'd	Portions/Case:					960.0000						
	Case Size:					30.0000						
	Pounds DF/Case:					21.7200						
	Fee For Service/Case:					23.0300						
	DF # Value/Case					39.7500						
	Net (NOI) Price/Case					23.0300						
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion					0.0410						
	Unit Price Per Case:					0.0650						

Item No.	Vendor	Advance Pierre Cincinnati, OH	American Foods Group Oklahoma City, OK	Asian Food Solutions Oviedo, FL	Beaver Valley Aliquippa, PA	Bongards Bongards, MN	Brookwood Farms Siler City, NC	Cargill Kitchen Monticello, MN	Cargill Meat Solutions Wichita, KS	Chef's Corner Foods Hayward, CA	ConAgra Foods Troy, OH	ES Foods Woodbury, NY
41	American Cheese, 5 Pound Loaves (0516341)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	a-u	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Not	Portion Size - ozs.:					1.0000						
Aw'd	Portions/Case:					480.0000						
	Case Size:					30.0000						
	Pounds DF/Case:					21.5500						
	Fee For Service/Case:					26.7000						
	DF # Value/Case					39.4400						
	Net (NOI) Price/Case					66.1400						
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion					0.0820						
	Unit Price Per Case:					0.1380						
42	Cheese Portions, Cheddar Cheese, Reduced Fat, Mild (0517640)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Not	Portion Size - ozs.:											
Aw'd	Portions/Case:											
	Case Size:											
	Pounds DF/Case:											
	Fee For Service/Case:											
	DF # Value/Case											
	Net (NOI) Price/Case											
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion											
	Unit Price Per Case:											
43	Cheese, Swiss, Sliced, Reduced Fat (0517500)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	a-u	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Not	Portion Size - ozs.:					0.7500						
Aw'd	Portions/Case:					256.0000						
	Case Size:					12.0000						
	Pounds DF/Case:					12.0000						
	Fee For Service/Case:					14.5500						
	DF # Value/Case					21.9600						
	Net (NOI) Price/Case					36.5100						
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion					0.0850						
	Unit Price Per Case:					0.0143						

Item No.	Vendor	Advance Pierre Cincinnati, OH	American Foods Group Oklahoma City, OK	Asian Food Solutions Oviedo, FL	Beaver Valley Aliquippa, PA	Bongards Bongards, MN	Brookwood Farms Siler City, NC	Cargill Kitchen Monticello, MN	Cargill Meat Solutions Wichita, KS	Chef's Corner Foods Hayward, CA	ConAgra Foods Troy, OH	ES Foods Woodbury, NY
44	Cheddar Cheese, Shredded, Reduced Sodium (0516360)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	a-u	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Not	Portion Size - ozs.:					0.5000						
Aw'd	Portions/Case:					320.0000						
	Case Size:					20.0000						
	Pounds DF/Case:					20.0000						
	Fee For Service/Case:					13.2000						
	DF # Value/Case					36.6000						
	Net (NOI) Price/Case					49.8000						
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion					0.1140						
	Unit Price Per Case:					0.1360						
45	Macaroni and Cheese, Reduced Fat, Reduced Sodium, Whole Grain (0517600)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	a-y	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	a-y
	Portion Size - ozs.:				6.0000							6.0000
	Portions/Case:				80.0000							80.0000
	Case Size:				30.0000							30.0000
	Pounds DF/Case:				4.5900							6.6520
	Fee For Service/Case:				28.3000							35.9000
	DF # Value/Case				8.4000							0.4488
	Net (NOI) Price/Case				28.3000							0.6007
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion				0.3530							
	Unit Price Per lb:				0.5200							
46	Bread Sticks, Cheese Filled, Reduced Fat (0516640)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.9500	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:										192.0000	
	Portions/Case:											
	Case Size:										9.0900	
	Pounds DF/Case:										23.9900	
	Fee For Service/Case:										15.6100	
	DF # Value/Case										23.9900	
	Net (NOI) Price/Case										0.1250	
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion										0.1250	
	Unit Price Each:										0.0813	

Item No.	Vendor	Giorgio Foods Temple, PA	Goodman Food Products Inglewood, CA	High Liner Foods Drivers, MA	Jennie-O Willmar, MN	J.R. Simplot Boise, ID	JTM ProcessingHarri son, OH	Ling's 5th Taste EI Monte, CA	Maid-Rate Dummore, PA	Michael Foods Minnetonka, MN	Nardone Bros Baking Co Wilkes-Barre, PA	Pilgrim's Pride Corporation Tucker, GA
1	Sweet and Sour Chicken (0516820)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	m	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:							3.6000				
	Portions/Case:							192.0000				
	Case Size:							30.00/30.00				
	Pounds DF/Case:							38.0500				
	Fee For Service/Case:							103.6800				
	DF # Value/Case							26.3800				
	Net (NOI) Price/Case							130.0600				
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion							0.5400				
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):							1.7280				
2	Smoked BBQ Teriyaki Chicken (0516830)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	m	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:							2.8000				
	Portions/Case:							240.0000				
	Case Size:							30.00/12.00				
	Pounds DF/Case:							45.9200				
	Fee For Service/Case:							78.4600				
	DF # Value/Case							31.8400				
	Net (NOI) Price/Case							110.3000				
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion							0.3269				
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):							1.8681				
3	Mandarin Orange Chicken (0516840)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	m	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:							3.6000				
	Portions/Case:							192.0000				
	Case Size:							30.00/30.00				
	Pounds DF/Case:							38.0500				
	Fee For Service/Case:							96.5500				
	DF # Value/Case							26.3800				
	Net (NOI) Price/Case							122.9300				
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion							0.5028				
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):							1.6092				

Item No.	Vendor	Giorgio Foods Temple, PA	Goodman Food Products Inglewood, CA	High Liner Foods Drivers, MA	Jennie-O Willmar, MN	J.R. Simplot Boise, ID	JTM Processing Harri son, OH	Ling's 5th Taste El Monte, CA	Maid-Rate Dummore, PA	Michael Foods Minnetonka, MN	Nardone Bros Baking Co Wilkes-Barre, PA	Pilgrim's Pride Corporation Tucker, GA
19	Beef Crumbles (0516970)	No Bid	a+Y	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	m	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:		2.2000				2.0000		2.1000			
	Portions/Case:		290.0000				240.0000		228.0000			
	Case Size:		(?) 40.0000				30.0000		30.0000			
	Pounds DF/Case:		36.3300				25.5300		42.8550			
	Fee For Service/Case:		24.0000				23.6600		27.6000			
	DF # Value/Case		80.9100				56.8600		95.4400			
	Net (NOI) Price/Case						23.6600					
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion						0.0986					
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):		0.6000				0.7887		0.9200			
20	Beef Taco Meat - Reduced Sodium (0516170)	No Bid	m	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	m	No Bid	a-Y, m	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:		3.0300				3.1700		2.3500			
	Portions/Case:		158.0000				151.0000		204.0000			
	Case Size:		30.0000				30.0000		30.0000			
	Pounds DF/Case:		16.4700				16.7000		22.9410			
	Fee For Service/Case:		23.4900				22.4100		30.6000			
	DF # Value/Case		36.6800				37.1900		51.0900			
	Net (NOI) Price/Case						22.4100					
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion						0.1484					
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):		0.7830				0.7470		1.0200			
21	Beef Meatballs (0516191)	No Bid	a-Y, m	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	m	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:		2.0000				2.8000		2.4000			
	Portions/Case:		240.0000				171.0000		200.0000			
	Case Size:		30.0000				30.0000		30.0000			
	Pounds DF/Case:		28.6300				22.9400		25.4150			
	Fee For Service/Case:		24.9900				22.8400		28.5000			
	DF # Value/Case		63.7600				51.0900		56.6000			
	Net (NOI) Price/Case						22.8400					
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion						0.1336					
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):		0.1041				0.1336		0.1425			

Item No.	Vendor	Giorgio Foods Temple, PA	Goodman Food Products Inglewood, CA	High Liner Foods Drivers, MA	Jennie-O Willmar, MN	J.R. Simplot Boise, ID	JTM ProcessingHarri son, OH	Ling's 5th Taste El Monte, CA	Maid-Rate Dummore, PA	Michael Foods Minnetonka, MN	Nardone Bros Baking Co Wilkes-Barre, PA	Pilgrim's Pride Corporation Tucker, GA
22	Turkey Sausage, Patty (0516210)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	m	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:				1.0250							
	Portions/Case:				160.0000							
	Case Size:				10.2500							
	Pounds DF/Case:				9.9700							
	Fee For Service/Case:				17.9400							
	DF # Value/Case				10.8000							
	Net (NOI) Price/Case				17.9400							
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion				0.1121							
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):				0.1121							
23	Turkey Ham (0516221)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	m	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:				3.5800							
	Portions/Case:				71.0000							
	Case Size:				16.0000							
	Pounds DF/Case:				14.2500							
	Fee For Service/Case:				19.68 or 1.23/lb							
	DF # Value/Case				15.4400							
	Net (NOI) Price/Case				19.68 or 1.23/lb							
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion				0.2772							
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):				0.4946							
24	Turkey Ham, Deli Style (0516220)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	m	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:				3.0600							
	Portions/Case:				62.0000							
	Case Size:				12.0000							
	Pounds DF/Case:				13.2600							
	Fee For Service/Case:				19.8000							
	DF # Value/Case				14.3600							
	Net (NOI) Price/Case				19.8000							
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion				0.3194							
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):				1.6500							
25	Roast Turkey Breast, Sliced (0516340)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	m	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:				3.3500							
	Portions/Case:				57.0000							
	Case Size:				12.0000							
	Pounds DF/Case:				10.4700							
	Fee For Service/Case:				27.1200							
	DF # Value/Case				11.3400							
	Net (NOI) Price/Case				27.1200							
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion				0.4758							
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):				2.2600							

Item No.	Vendor	Giorgio Foods Temple, PA	Goodman Food Products Inglewood, CA	High Liner Foods Drivers, MA	Jennie-O Willmar, MN	J.R. Simplot Boise, ID	JTM Processing Harri son, OH	Ling's 5th Taste El Monte, CA	Maid-Rate Dummore, PA	Michael Foods Minnetonka, MN	Nardone Bros Baking Co Wilkes-Barre, PA	Pilgrim's Pride Corporation Tucker, GA
26	Turkey Breast, Roasted, Sliced (0516960)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	m	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:				3.0000							
	Portions/Case:				64.0000							
	Case Size:				12.0000							
	Pounds DF/Case:				10.7100							
	Fee For Service/Case:				20.4000							
	DF # Value/Case				11.6000							
	Net (NOI) Price/Case				20.4000							
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion				0.3188							
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):				1.7000							
27	Turkey Roast (0516311)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	m	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:				4.00/2.29							
	Portions/Case:				86.00/234							
	Case Size:				21.70/44.80							
	Pounds DF/Case:				37.7500							
	Fee For Service/Case:				82.8800							
	DF # Value/Case				40.8900							
	Net (NOI) Price/Case				2.64/lbs/82.88							
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion				0.6662/0.3542							
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):				1.8500							
28	Beef, Flame Broiled Patty (0516113)	No Bid	a-u, m	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	m	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:		2.5000				2.2000					
	Portions/Case:		200.0000				228.0000					
	Case Size:		31.2500				31.4300					
	Pounds DF/Case:		22.8400				25.2300					
	Fee For Service/Case:		19.8400				24.1200					
	DF # Value/Case		50.8600				56.1900					
	Net (NOI) Price/Case						24.1200					
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion						0.1058					
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):		0.0992				0.1058					
29	Country Fried Steak (0516150)	No Bid	m	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	a-Y, m	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:		3.8000				3.3500					
	Portions/Case:		130.0000				137.0000					
	Case Size:		30.8800				28.8900					
	Pounds DF/Case:		22.0700				20.5900					
	Fee For Service/Case:		23.6500				32.6300					
	DF # Value/Case		49.1500				45.8500					
	Net (NOI) Price/Case						32.6300					
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion						0.2382					
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):		0.1819				0.2382					

Item No.	Vendor	Giorgio Foods Temple, PA	Goodman Food Products Inglewood, CA	High Liner Foods Drivers, MA	Jennie-O Willmar, MN	J.R. Simplot Boise, ID	JTM Processing Harri son, OH	Ling's 5th Taste El Monte, CA	Maid-Rate Dummore, PA	Michael Foods Minnetonka, MN	Nardone Bros Baking Co Wilkes-Barre, PA	Pilgrim's Pride Corporation Tucker, GA
30	Beef Steak Cooked, Breaded (0516132)	No Bid	m	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:		1.6000									
	Portions/Case:		300.0000									
	Case Size:		30.0000									
	Pounds DF/Case:		29.8300									
	Fee For Service/Case:		23.7600									
	DF # Value/Case		66.4200									
	Net (NOI) Price/Case											
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion											
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):		0.0792									
31	Beef, Mini Burgers (0515120)	No Bid	a-Y, m	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	m	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:		1.2000				1.1500					
	Portions/Case:		400.0000				417.0000					
	Case Size:		30.0000				30.0000					
	Pounds DF/Case:		43.5400				25.2300					
	Fee For Service/Case:		20.7300				24.1200					
	DF # Value/Case		96.9700				56.1900					
	Net (NOI) Price/Case						24.1200					
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion						0.0578					
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):		0.1037				0.1157					
32	Beef, Mini Cheeseburgers (0515090)	No Bid	a-Y, m	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	m	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:		4.7400				5.0000					
	Portions/Case:		72.0000				80.0000					
	Case Size:		21.3300				25.0000					
	Pounds DF/Case:		16.8900				9.6700					
	Fee For Service/Case:		26.8600				49.8800					
	DF # Value/Case		37.6100				21.5400					
	Net (NOI) Price/Case						49.8800					
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion						0.6235					
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):		0.3731				0.6235					
33	Beef, Shaved Steak (Philly Steak) (0517530)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	m	No Bid	a-u, m	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:						2.9200		2.2000			
	Portions/Case:						164.0000		218.0000			
	Case Size:						30.0000		6/5 lb			
	Pounds DF/Case:						33.3300		41.4630			
	Fee For Service/Case:						46.4100		45.3000			
	DF # Value/Case						74.2300		92.3400			
	Net (NOI) Price/Case						46.4100					
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion						0.2830					
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):						1.5470		1.5100			

Item No.	Vendor	Giorgio Foods Temple, PA	Goodman Food Products Inglewood, CA	High Liner Foods Drivers, MA	Jennie-O Willmar, MN	J.R. Simplot Boise, ID	JTM Processing Harri son, OH	Ling's 5th Taste El Monte, CA	Maid-Rate Dummore, PA	Michael Foods Minnetonka, MN	Nardone Bros Baking Co Wilkes-Barre, PA	Pilgrim's Pride Corporation Tucker, GA
43	Cheese, Swiss, Sliced, Reduced Fat (0517500)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:											
	Portions/Case:											
	Case Size:											
	Pounds DF/Case:											
	Fee For Service/Case:											
	DF # Value/Case											
	Net (NOI) Price/Case											
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion											
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):											
44	Cheddar Cheese, Shredded, Reduced Sodium (0516360)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:											
	Portions/Case:											
	Case Size:											
	Pounds DF/Case:											
	Fee For Service/Case:											
	DF # Value/Case											
	Net (NOI) Price/Case											
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion											
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):											
45	Macaroni and Cheese, Reduced Fat, Reduced Sodium, Whole Grain (0517600)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	m	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:						6.0000					
	Portions/Case:						80.0000					
	Case Size:						30.0000					
	Pounds DF/Case:						5.1200					
	Fee For Service/Case:						28.3500					
	DF # Value/Case						9.3700					
	Net (NOI) Price/Case						28.3500					
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion						0.3544					
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):						0.4715					

Item No.	Vendor	Giorgio Foods Temple, PA	Goodman Food Products Inglewood, CA	High Liner Foods Drivers, MA	Jennie-O Willmar, MN	J.R. Simplot Boise, ID	JTM ProcessingHarri son, OH	Ling's 5th Taste El Monte, CA	Maid-Rate Dummore, PA	Michael Foods Minnetonka, MN	Nardone Bros Baking Co Wilkes-Barre, PA	Pilgrim's Pride Corporation Tucker, GA
54	Spaghetti Sauce (0508050)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:											
	Portions/Case:											
	Case Size:											
	Pounds DF/Case:											
	Fee For Service/Case:											
	DF # Value/Case											
	Net (NOI) Price/Case											
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion											
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):											
55	Whole Grain Cheese Lasagna Rollup (0514500)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:											
	Portions/Case:											
	Case Size:											
	Pounds DF/Case:											
	Fee For Service/Case:											
	DF # Value/Case											
	Net (NOI) Price/Case											
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion											
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):											
56	Omelet, Colby Cheese (0516080)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:									2.1000		
	Portions/Case:									144.0000		
	Case Size:									18.9000		
	Pounds DF/Case:									11.8200		
	Fee For Service/Case:									26.5000		
	DF # Value/Case									7.8800		
	Net (NOI) Price/Case									34.3800		
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion									0.2388		
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):									0.1840		
57	Potatoes, Roasted Chunks (0514430)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Portion Size - ozs.:					1/2 cup						
	Portions/Case:					75.0000						
	Case Size:					6/2.5 lb						
	Pounds DF/Case:					18.7500						
	Fee For Service/Case:					15.8500						
	DF # Value/Case					1.8200						
	Net (NOI) Price/Case					15.8500						
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion					0.2114						
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):					0.2114						

Item No.	Vendor	Red Gold LLC Elwood, IN	Sara Lee Chicago, IL	Schwan's Food Service Marshall, MN	Tasty Brands Hicksville, NY	Tyson Prepared Foods Springdale, AR						
5	Kung Pao Chicken Without Vegetables	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						
	Portion Size - ozs.:											
	Portions/Case:											
	Case Size:											
	Pounds DF/Case:											
	Fee For Service/Case:											
	DF # Value/Case											
	Net (NOI) Price/Case											
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion											
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):											
6	Chicken, 8 Piece Breaded (0516550)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							
	Portion Size - ozs.:					4pc?						
	Portions/Case:					57.0000						
	Case Size:					25.0000						
	Pounds DF/Case:					19.4600						
	Fee For Service/Case:					28.7500						
	DF # Value/Case					18.5000						
	Net (NOI) Price/Case					28.7500						
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion					0.5044						
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):					1.1500						
7	Chicken, 8 Piece Roasted (0516540)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							
	Portion Size - ozs.:					4 pc						
	Portions/Case:					60.0000						
	Case Size:					25.0000						
	Pounds DF/Case:					20.6100						
	Fee For Service/Case:					30.0000						
	DF # Value/Case					19.5800						
	Net (NOI) Price/Case					30.0000						
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion					0.5000						
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):					1.2000						
8	Chicken Patty or Slider, Breakfast, Breaded (0516581)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							
	Portion Size - ozs.:					1.4500						
	Portions/Case:					200.0000						
	Case Size:					18.1200						
	Pounds DF/Case:					12.0800						
	Fee For Service/Case:					11.9700						
	DF # Value/Case					10.3200						
	Net (NOI) Price/Case					11.9700						
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion					0.0599						
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):					0.0599						

Item No.	Vendor	Red Gold LLC Elwood, IN	Sara Lee Chicago, IL	Schwan's Food Service Marshall, MN	Tasty Brands Hicksville, NY	Tyson Prepared Foods Springdale, AR						
9	Chicken Patty, Home-Style, Breaded (0516901)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							
	Portion Size - ozs.:					3.2600						
	Portions/Case:					150.0000						
	Case Size:					30.5600						
	Pounds DF/Case:					14.4800						
	Fee For Service/Case:					36.5200						
	DF # Value/Case					12.3600						
	Net (NOI) Price/Case					36.5200						
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion					0.2437						
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):					0.2435						
10	Chicken Patty, Breaded, Hot and Spicy (0516910)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							
	Portion Size - ozs.:					3.2300						
	Portions/Case:					150.0000						
	Case Size:					30.2800						
	Pounds DF/Case:					26.8300						
	Fee For Service/Case:					31.7900						
	DF # Value/Case					22.2900						
	Net (NOI) Price/Case					31.7900						
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion					0.2119						
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):					0.2119						
11	Chicken Nugget, Home-Style Breaded (0516521)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							
	Portion Size - ozs.:					3.4500						
	Portions/Case:					150.0000						
	Case Size:					32.8100						
	Pounds DF/Case:					15.3800						
	Fee For Service/Case:					13.1400						
	DF # Value/Case					36.0900						
	Net (NOI) Price/Case					13.1400						
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion					0.0876						
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):					0.0876						

Item No.	Vendor	Red Gold LLC Elwood, IN	Sara Lee Chicago, IL	Schwan's Food Service Marshall, MN	Tasty Brands Hicksville, NY	Tyson Prepared Foods Springdale, AR						
12	Chicken Tender-Shaped Strips Breaded (0516860)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							
	Portion Size - ozs.:					3.3900						
	Portions/Case:					150.0000						
	Case Size:					31.8600						
	Pounds DF/Case:					14.9400						
	Fee For Service/Case:					35.0500						
	DF # Value/Case					12.7600						
	Net (NOI) Price/Case					35.0500						
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion					0.2337						
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):					0.2337						
13	Chicken Tenders, Breaded (0516650)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							
	Portion Size - ozs.:					3.8400						
	Portions/Case:					125.0000						
	Case Size:					30.0000						
	Pounds DF/Case:					30.9000						
	Fee For Service/Case:					67.5000						
	DF # Value/Case					26.4000						
	Net (NOI) Price/Case					67.5000						
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion					0.5400						
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):					0.5400						
14	Popcorn Chicken, Breaded (0516871)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							
	Portion Size - ozs.:					3.8500						
	Portions/Case:					124.0000						
	Case Size:					30.0000						
	Pounds DF/Case:					25.1700						
	Fee For Service/Case:					37.8000						
	DF # Value/Case					21.5000						
	Net (NOI) Price/Case					37.8000						
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion					0.3048						
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):					0.3048						
15	Chicken Breast Filets, Breaded (0516930)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							
	Portion Size - ozs.:					4.3500						
	Portions/Case:					110.0000						
	Case Size:					30.0000						
	Pounds DF/Case:					25.8200						
	Fee For Service/Case:					66.0000						
	DF # Value/Case					22.0600						
	Net (NOI) Price/Case					66.0000						
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion					0.6000						
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):					0.6000						

Item No.	Vendor	Red Gold LLC Elwood, IN	Sara Lee Chicago, IL	Schwan's Food Service Marshall, MN	Tasty Brands Hicksville, NY	Tyson Prepared Foods Springdale, AR						
16	Popcorn Chicken, Spicy, Breaded (0516880)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							
	Portion Size - ozs.:					3.3000						
	Portions/Case:					159.0000						
	Case Size:					32.7900						
	Pounds DF/Case:					15.3700						
	Fee For Service/Case:					39.3500						
	DF # Value/Case					13.1200						
	Net (NOI) Price/Case					39.3500						
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion					0.2475						
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):					0.2475						
17	Chicken Fajita Strips (0516890)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							
	Portion Size - ozs.:					2.7300						
	Portions/Case:					234.0000						
	Case Size:					39.9300						
	Pounds DF/Case:					86.5400						
	Fee For Service/Case:					57.9000						
	DF # Value/Case					73.8800						
	Net (NOI) Price/Case					57.9000						
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion					0.2474						
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):					0.2474						
18	Grilled Chicken Patty (0516560)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							
	Portion Size - ozs.:					2.8000						
	Portions/Case:					174.0000						
	Case Size:					30.4500						
	Pounds DF/Case:					36.0600						
	Fee For Service/Case:					53.2900						
	DF # Value/Case					30.8000						
	Net (NOI) Price/Case					53.2900						
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion					0.3063						
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):					0.3063						
19	Beef Crumbles (0516970)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid							
	Portion Size - ozs.:					2.2000						
	Portions/Case:					290.0000						
	Case Size:					40.0000						
	Pounds DF/Case:					39.8900						
	Fee For Service/Case:					38.0000						
	DF # Value/Case					90.5300						
	Net (NOI) Price/Case					38.0000						
	Net (NOI) Price/Portion					0.1310						
	Total Price/Case (Includes DF \$ Value):					0.9500						

a = Alternate Product Bid											
au = Alternate product bid. Product not approved in taste test or no sample was sent by bidder.											
aY = Alternate product bid. Product was approved in taste.											
m = Bidder bid minimum ship quantities											

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at:
<http://old.escambia.k12.fl.us/adminoff/finance/purchasing/>

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, and School Board rules shall constitute a waiver of proceedings.
 Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing website address. Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie, Director
 Purchasing Department
